

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Thomas Palmosina
Stephen T. Simcic
Acting Executive Directors

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: 2011 Catch Basin Cleaning, 11007CBCC REBID
(Res. 2 of 2011)

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: _____

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: Jan – Dec 2011

DATE ADVERTISED: Dec 8 & 12, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Jan 7, 2011

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 3

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 3

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Jet Jack, Inc.

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Catch Basin Replacement Contract
R-B2.10025-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Catch Basin Replacement

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Sep 29, 2010 and Oct 3, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 21, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 4

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 3

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Independent, Mele & Mele & Sons, Facchiano
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Independent Enterprises

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: 2011 Chemicals
10028CHEM

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Purchase of Chemicals for 2011 Year

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: Jan – Dec 2011

DATE ADVERTISED: Oct 24 & 27, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Nov 15, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 22

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 12

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Sal Chemical, LCI Ltd., Carmeuse, PVS Technologies, Carus Corp., Neo Solutions, Inc., Chemrite, Inc., Kemira Water, Polydyne, Inc., Univar USA, Inc., Applied Specialities USALCO

AWARD GIVEN TO: Carmeuse, PVS, Carus, Polydyne, Univar (based on lowest bid per item)
LATE BIDS (NAME): USALCO submitted a "no bid" late via email

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Ductile Iron Pipe
R-A1.11002

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Purchase of Ductile Iron Pipe

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR
EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Oct 10 & 13, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 27, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 15

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 6

REJECTED BIDS
(NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING
"NO BID" (NAME): L/B Water Service, Inc., Pipelines, Inc., National Road Utility
Supply, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks, James M Cox Co.
US Pipe & Foundry Co.

AWARD GIVEN TO:
LATE BIDS (NAME): L/B Water Service, Inc., Pipelines, Inc., National Road Utility
Supply, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks
N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY
RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR
AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE
EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE:	<u>Ductile Iron Pipe Fittings</u> <u>R-A1.11003-21</u>
SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION:	<u>Purchase of Ductile Iron Pipe Fittings</u>
CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE:	<u>N/A</u> <u>N/A</u>
DATE ADVERTISED:	<u>Oct 10 & Oct 13, 2010</u>
PROPOSAL DUE DATE:	<u>Oct 28, 2010</u>
BIDS SENT (NUMBER):	<u>15</u>
BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER):	<u>5</u>
REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON):	<u>Ferguson Waterworks, Item C29 only</u> <u>Lowest price was based on a case of 60 units, not 100 units</u> <u>as required by bid documents</u>
VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME):	<u>L/B Water Service, Inc., Trumbull Industries, Ferguson</u> <u>Waterworks, National Road Utility Supply, Inc., Pipelines, Inc</u> <u>N/A</u>
AWARD GIVEN TO: LATE BIDS (NAME):	<u>L/B Water Service, Inc., Trumbull Industries, Pipelines, Inc.,</u> <u>Ferguson Waterworks (Awards based on lowest bid per</u> <u>item)</u> <u>N/A</u>
DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD:	<u>PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY</u>
WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)?	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION	<u>Ferguson Waterworks based bid for Item C29 on incorrect n</u> <u>number of units per case, award was given to next lowest</u> <u>bid in compliance with bid documents</u>

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Various Ductile Iron Transition Couplings
R-A1.11003-31

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Purchase of Various Ductile Iron Transition Couplings

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Oct 13 & 17, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 29, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 15

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 5

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Trumbull Industries, L/B Water Service, Inc., National Road Utility Supply, Inc.
US Pipe & Foundry Co., Pipelines, Inc.

AWARD GIVEN TO: Trumbull Industries, L/B Water Service, Inc., National Road Utility Supply, Inc. (based on lowest bid per item)

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Emergency Sewer Operations Repair
11008ESOR

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Repair of Emergency Sewer Operations

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Nov 7 & 10, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Nov 30, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 4

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 4

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Independent Enterprises, Inc., A Merante Contracting, Frank J Zottola Construction, Inc., Michael Facchiano Contracting
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Independent Enterprises
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE:	<u>Gate & Tapping Valves & Tapping Sleeves</u> <u>R-A1.11004</u>
SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION:	<u>Purchase of Gate & Tapping Valves & Tapping Sleeves</u>
CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE:	<u>N/A</u> <u>N/A</u>
DATE ADVERTISED:	<u>Oct 10 & 13, 2010</u>
PROPOSAL DUE DATE:	<u>Oct 27, 2010</u>
BIDS SENT (NUMBER):	<u>15</u>
BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER):	<u>8</u>
REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON):	<u>Trumbull Industries</u> <u>Bids for some items not in compliance with bid spec's</u>
VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME):	<u>L/B Water Service, Inc., Trumbull Industries, James M Cox Co., National Road Utility Supply, Inc., Pipelines, Inc., East Jordan Iron Works, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks</u> <u>US Pipe & Foundry Co.</u>
AWARD GIVEN TO: LATE BIDS (NAME):	<u>L/B Water Service, James M Cox Inc., East Jordan Iron Works, Ferguson Waterworks, Trumbull Industries, National Road Utility Supply, Inc.,</u> <u>(Award given to lowest bid per item)</u> <u>N/A</u>
DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD:	<u>PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY</u>
WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)?	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION	<u>Bids from Trumbull Industries for some items were not in compliance with bid specification. In these cases, award was made to next lowest bidder in compliance</u>

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Gunite Contract
R-B2.10018-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Sewer Rehabilitation, Gunite at various location

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: N/A

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Dec 2, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): N/A

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 1

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Graciano Corporation
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Graciano Corporation
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Thomas Palmosina
Stephen T. Simcic
Acting Executive Directors

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Health Insurance
(Res. 9 of 2011)

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Awarding Operating Contract(s) for Health Insurance

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: One Year (Effective 2/1/11)

DATE ADVERTISED: N/A

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: N/A

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 2

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 2

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Highmark

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Manhole Catch Basin Point Repair
R-B2.11009-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Manhole Catch Basin Point Repair

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR
EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Nov 14 & 17, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: December 2, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 4

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 3

REJECTED BIDS
(NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING
"NO BID" (NAME): Independent Enterprises, Frank J Zottola Construction, A
Merante Contracting

AWARD GIVEN TO: Independent Enterprises
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY
RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR
AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE
EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Renewal of Property and Crime Insurance

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Renewal of Property and Crime Insurance

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: Two Year Rate Guarantee
1/1/13

DATE ADVERTISED: N/A

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: N/A

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 4

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 2

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING Travelers Insurance Co., Chubb Insurance Co.
Housing & Redevelopment Insurance Exchange,
Selective Insurance

"NO BID" (NAME):
AWARD GIVEN TO: Travelers Insurance Company
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Thomas Palmosina
Stephen T. Simcic
Acting Executive Directors

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Purchase of Large UME's, R-E1.11013
(Res. 1 of 2011)

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: _____

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Nov 28 & Dec 1, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Jan 6, 2011

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 1

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 1

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: EAP Industries, Inc.

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: PVC Sewer Pipe
R-B2.11005

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Purchase of PVC Sewer Pipe

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Oct 10 & 13, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 28, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 15

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 5

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A
N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Pipelines Inc., L/B Water Services, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks, National Road Utility Supply, Inc.
US Pipe & Foundry Co.

AWARD GIVEN TO: L/B Water Service, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks, Pipelines, Inc. (based on lowest bid per item)
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Rehabilitation of Clarifiers
R-A3.07018

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Rehabilitation of Clarifiers at the Water Treatment Plant

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Oct 13 & 17, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 29, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 5

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 4

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): Graciano Corp., R G Friday Restoration, Eastern Waterproofing & Restoration, Airtite Company
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Graciano Corporation

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Sewer Improvement Contract
R-B2.10023-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Sewer Improvement at various locations

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR
EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Sep 29, 2010 and Oct 3, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 20, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 6

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 1

REJECTED BIDS
(NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING
"NO BID" (NAME): Independent Enterprises
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO:
LATE BIDS (NAME): Independent Enterprises
N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY
RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR
AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE
EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE:	<u>Stainless Steel Repair Clamps</u> <u>R-A1.11003-41</u>
SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION:	<u>Purchase of Stainless Steel Repair Clamps</u>
CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE:	<u>N/A</u> <u>N/A</u>
DATE ADVERTISED:	<u>Oct 10 & 13, 2010</u>
PROPOSAL DUE DATE:	<u>October 28, 2010</u>
BIDS SENT (NUMBER):	<u>15</u>
BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER):	<u>6</u>
REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON):	<u>N/A</u>
VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME):	<u>Pipelines, Inc., L/B Water Service, Inc., National Road Utility Service, Inc., Ferguson Waterworks, James M Cox Co., Trumbull Industries</u> <u>Pipelines, Inc.</u>
AWARD GIVEN TO:	<u>L/B Water Service Inc., Ferguson Waterworks, James M. Cox</u> <u>(Award given to lowest bid per item)</u>
LATE BIDS (NAME):	<u>N/A</u>
DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD:	<u>PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY</u>
WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)?	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>
IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION	<u>_____</u> <u>_____</u> <u>_____</u> <u>_____</u>

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: STREET REPAVING SEWER RISERS/LIDS(W&S CASTINGS)
R-E1.10026

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: RISERS/LIDS FOR USE WITH STREET REPAVING

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: 1 YEAR

DATE ADVERTISED: SEPT. 12 AND 15, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: SEPT. 27, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 4

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 3

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): 0

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): BINGHAM & TAYLOR; NEENAH FOUNDRY CO; EAST JORDAN IRON WORKS PIPELINES, INC.

AWARD GIVEN TO: VARIOUS

LATE BIDS (NAME): NA

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Waterline Replacement Contract
R-A1.10024-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Waterline Replacement

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR
EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Sep 29, 2010 and Oct 3, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 20, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 8

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 3

REJECTED BIDS
(NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING
"NO BID" (NAME): Astco Construction, Independent Enterprises, W G Tomko
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: Astco Construction
LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY
RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR
AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE
EXPLANATION

THE PITTSBURGH WATER AND SEWER AUTHORITY

Michael P. Kenney
Executive Director

Penn Liberty Plaza I
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412 255-8800
FAX: 412 393-0522

BID TITLE: Water Valve & Fire Hydrant Replacement
R-A1.1006-21

SPECIFICATION DESCRIPTION: Valve & Hydrant Replacement

CONTRACT DURATION AND/OR EXPIRATION DATE: N/A
N/A

DATE ADVERTISED: Sep 29, 2010 and Oct 3, 2010

PROPOSAL DUE DATE: Oct 21, 2010

BIDS SENT (NUMBER): 6

BIDS RECEIVED (NUMBER): 2

REJECTED BIDS (NAME / REASON): N/A

VENDORS SUBMITTING "NO BID" (NAME): W G Tomko, Independent Enterprises
N/A

AWARD GIVEN TO: W G Tomko

LATE BIDS (NAME): N/A

DEPARTMENT / AUTHORITY RECOMMENDING AWARD: PITTSBURGH WATER & SEWER AUTHORITY

WAS AWARD MADE TO LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)? YES NO

IF NO, DEPARTMENT AND/OR AUTHORITY MUST PROVIDE EXPLANATION

